
VERA PIETRA NATURALE

ECO 303
Natural Paglierino 

Cost (Mq.)

Selected to highlight the 
natural golden oxidation of 
the stone, these products are 
ideal for creating both 
interior and external wall 
coverings, providing a warm 
and visually-strong element to 
living areas.
They lend themselves to the 
creation of dry-laid walls and 
to garden landscaping 
compositions.
The master workmanship, 
together with the professional 
standards and quality of the 
materials makes each 
Ecopietra product unique, 
setting it apart for originality 
and style.

FORMATS SUPPLIED:
pallets:
- sizes 80x120x h. 85 cm
- sizes 80x120x h. 85 cm

packaging:
zinc-plated wire meshing

coverage:
- 5/6 square meters per pallet
- 5/6 square meters per pallet

weight:
1500 kg/pallet

STONES BY NAME:
Hard limestone.

TYPE:
ECO 303
PAGLIERINO SLABS with 
natural broken edge or hand-
split butt edge.

SIZES:
thickness from. 4 to 18 cm.
depth max 15 cm.


